
Specials may vary by location
Before placing your order, please inform your server if anyone in your party has a food allergy.

* These items are cooked to order and/or may be served raw or undercooked. Consuming raw or undercooked 
meat, fish, poultry or eggsmay increase your risk of foodborne illness.

BRINA CREMA MARTINI
Jefferson’s Bourbon, Amaretto, 
Dark Créme de Cacao, Half & 
Half, Shaved Chocolate.

$10

CHILI
A hearty chili topped with 
Monterey Jack and Cheddar 
cheese, sour cream and scallions.

MEATBALL SLIDERS
Housemade meatballs cooked in 
a pomodoro sauce and topped 
with ricotta cheese, served on a 
toasted brioche slider bun with 
artisan greens tossed in pesto.

$12

CUP $6   BOWL $8

JAMESON AU POIVRE
BURGER*
Peppercorn crusted 8oz
All-Natural CAB burger topped 
with a Jameson au poivre sauce 
and served on a toasted brioche 
bun with artisan greens, pickle 
chips and sliced tomato. Served 
with a choice of one side.

$15

LINGUINI AND
MEATBALLS
Housemade meatballs served 
atop linguini tossed in pomodoro 
sauce, topped with ricotta cheese 
and chiffonade basil.

$16

CAJUN CRUSTED 
SIRLOIN*
Cajun crusted grilled sirloin 
served over garlic mashed 
potatoes and green beans, 
finished with a Jameson 
cream sauce.

$26


